
 

 

Garfield County Board of Commissioners Record 
Burwell, Garfield County, Nebraska 
 
The Garfield County Board of Commissioners met Tuesday, April 12th, 2022 at 1:30 p.m. in the 
Commissioners Room at the Garfield County Courthouse in Burwell, Nebraska pursuant to public notice 
posted in three public places & broadcast by KNLV Radio, Ord, NE. Chairman Krause called the meeting to 
order at 1:30 p.m. with the following present: Commissioners, Krause and Hurlburt. Absent, Jeffres. 
 
Motion made by Krause to approve the agenda, second by Hurlburt. Aye, Krause and Hurlburt, Nay, none; 
Absent, Jeffres. 
 
Motion made by Krause to approve & adopt minutes of last County Commissioners meeting held March 22nd, 
2022, second by Hurlburt. Aye, Krause and Hurlburt; Nay, none; Absent, Jeffres. 
 
Commissioner Hurlburt presented with information on various bills currently going through the legislature that 
she is actively watching.  
 
The agreement for bridge abandonment for the Goff bridge was tabled until next meeting.  
 
At 1:35 p.m., Chairman Krause recessed the regular meeting and opened the Board of Equalization. Kali Bolli, 
County Assessor, presented with tax list correction #559. Tammy Hitchcock, County Treasurer, presented with 
a form 457 for Kamp Kaleo. Motion made by Hurlburt to approve tax list correction #559 and form 457 as 
presented, second by Krause. Aye Krause and Hurlburt; Nay, none; Absent, Jeffres. At 1:38 p.m., Chairman 
Krause reconvened the regular meeting. 
 
Jimmy Petersen, County Weed Superintendent, presented with information on the weed department and 
updates with work he has been involved with in the past couple of months. He presented with a request for 
Garfield County to pay for his registration for the upcoming NAISMA conference to be held in Florida later this 
year. Motion made by Krause to approve the expenditure, second by Hurlburt. Aye, Krause and Hurlburt; Nay, 
none; Absent, Jeffres.  
 
A request from the Library Board was presented to the board regarding cost-of-living adjustment. After review 
of the Library Policy, the issue was tabled and Chairman Krause suggested the Clerk call the Librarian to 
request her to be present at the next regular Board meeting.  
 
Chairman Krause recessed the regular meeting at 1:57 p.m. and opened the public hearing for the conditional 
use permit for public recreational use for Hruza Brothers. Dan Hruza presented with information on the project. 
Kali Bolli, Planning and Zoning Administrator, added that the Planning and Zoning Board did approve the 
permit with no conditions. Chairman Krause closed the public hearing at 2:00 p.m. and reconvened the regular 
meeting. Motion made by Hurlburt to approve the conditional use permit, second by Krause. Aye, Krause and 
Hurlburt; Nay, none; Absent, Jeffres.  
 
Chairman Krause recessed the regular meeting at 2:02 p.m. and opened the public hearing for the modification 
of Garfield County Zoning Regulations. The proposed new map was presented to the Board for review and 
information given by Kali Bolli (Zoning Administrator), Barry Burnham (Zoning Board Chairman), and Keith 
Marvin (Marvin Planning Consultants). Chairman Krause closed the public hearing at 2:17 p.m. and 
reconvened the regular meeting. Motion made by Hurlburt to approve the proposed modifications to the 
Garfield County Planning and Zoning Regulations with the noted changes, second by Krause. Aye, Krause and 
Hurlburt; Nay, none; Absent, Jeffres. 
  
 
 
With no further business, Chairman Krause adjourned the meeting at 2:25 p.m. 
 



 

 

 
Attest: ______________________   Attest:  _______________________       Keri L. 
Koenigsberg,         Scott L. Krause, 
             Garfield County Clerk                    Chairman of the Board 


